
WOOSTER HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY DEMOLITION AND TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION FENCING

BID TABULATION SUMMARY SHEET

Published Total Estimated Cost For Demolition / Temporary Construction Fencing - $570,000.00

PROJECT NO. HII-1107800

PROJECT NAME: Madison Local School District Demolition and Temporary Construction Fencing                           Prime Contract for Demolition - $485,000.00                       Prime Contract for Temporary Construction Fencing - $85,000.00

DATE: THURSDAY June 23, 2011 - 2:00 PM

LOCATION: Madison Local School District Administration Building
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BID ITEM 1-  DEMOLITION 

PRIME CONTRACT BASE 

BID 

ALTERNATE NO. 1 - Cost 

for all demolition work 

based on asbestos-

containing reslient flooring 

covering systems and 

Regulated ACM being 

removed prior to 

demolition

Alternate No. 2 - Cost to 

complete demolition 

contract in (75) days

Alternate No. 3 - Cost to 

complete demolition 

contract in (65) days

Unit Price 1 - Excavation 

and off-site removal of 

contaminted solid waste 

soils - Price per gallon

Unit Price 1 - Excavation 

and off-site removal of 

contaminted solid waste 

soils - Price per ton

BID ITEM 2 - 

TEMPORARY 

CONSTRUCTION 

FENCING PRIME 

CONTRACT BASE BID

Combination Bid - Bid 

Item 1 and Bid Item 2

ACE DEMO, INC.

Letter 

of 

credit Yes Yes Yes $398,640.00 $0.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 No Bid No BidACE DEMO, INC. credit Yes Yes Yes $398,640.00 $0.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 No Bid No Bid

B&B WRECKING & EXCAVATING

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $346,500.00 No Bid $27,000.00 $45,000.00 No Bid No Bid

BAUMANN ENTERPRISES, INC.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $446,000.00 $10,000.00 $75,000.00 $100,000.00 No Bid $534,000.00

C TUCKER COPE & ASSOCIATES, INC.

Submitted wrong bid form - Non responsive Yes Yes Yes Yes No $312,544.00 $35,000.00 Nothing noted Nothing noted No Bid Nothing noted

DORE & ASSOCIATES CONTRACTING, INC.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $448,600.00 $33,100.00 $75,000.00 $105,000.00 No Bid No Bid

EARTH SAVERS, INC.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $519,000.00 $386,000.00 $50,000.00 $75,000.00 $42,000.00 $561,000.00

EVANS LANDSCAPING, INC.EVANS LANDSCAPING, INC.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $297,900.00 $22,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 Blank Blank

RITTER & PARATORE CONTRACTING, INC.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $346,770.00 $12,000.00 $27,000.00 $37,000.00 No Bid No Bid

WATSON GENERAL CONTRACTING LLC.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $413,184.00 $0.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $0.00 $463,818.00

GREAT NORTHERN FENCE

CUYAHOGA FENCE, LLC.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69,700.00 No Bid

SENTRY FENCE

Submitted wrong bid form - Non responsive Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid No Bid $54,000.00

BIDS OPENED AND READ BY: Robin Klenk, Madison Local Treasurer - Mike Brown, Heery International, Inc.

BIDS TABULATED BY:  Jeff Maver, Heery International, Inc.


